IFB 218-201

BID TABULATION

Generator Maintenance, Repair and Parts Water/Waste Water
March 15, 2018 at 2:00 P.M.
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1. Repair Service and Parts

2. Maintenance

Austin, TX

. ) Total Bid
Bidder Name and Total | -+ | Big | Total Bid | Total Bid | Total Bid | Total Bid | Total Bid | Total Bid | TotalBid | \pcard
Address of Service Bid | 1tem 1 item2 | Item2 | item3 | item3 | Item4 ltem 4 Level Level

Facility Item 1 | ocarg w/Pcard w/Pcard w/Pcard 1,2,3 1,2,3
Clifford Power Systems
4918 Burleson Rd. $85.00 $85.00 | $125.00 | $125.00 20% 20% | $175.00 | $175.00 | $55,640.00 | $55 640.00
Austin, TX
Kentech, Inc.
7943 E Evans Rd, $85.00 |  $85.00 | $127.50| $127.50 25% 25% $0.00 $0.00 | $49,840.00 | $49840.00
San Antonio, TX
Loftin Equipment Company
1241 Universal City Blvd $90.00 $90.00 $135.00 $135.00 25% 25%, $125.00 $125.00 $49,917.00 $49,917.00
Universal City TX
Snyder Power
29774 US Hwy 281 N $69.00 | $7141| $103.50 | $107.12 10% 10% | $150.00 | $155.25 | $58,281.12 | $60.321.01
Bulverde, TX
Flying V Generations
214 Turtle Bend $85.00 | $85.00| $128.00 | $128.00 10% 10% $0.00 $0.00 | $29,245.00 |  $29 245.00
| :orgetown, TX
Integrated Generator System
13401 US Hwy 87S $80.00 | $82.40| $120.00| $123.60 10% 10% N/A N/A | $64,704.00 | $66,645.12
Adkins, TX
Holt Texas LTD
5665 S.E. Loop 410 $135.00 | $135.00 | $202.50 | $202.50 | Consumer | Consumer | $150.00 | $150.00 | $57 894.00 | No Discount
San Antonio, Tx List List
LJ Power, Inc
9301 Hwy 290 W $85.00 $85.00 | $120.00| $120.00 15% 15% $50.00 $50.00 | $37,735.00 $37,735.00
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; i Total Bid
Bidder Name and Total | 121 Big | Total Bid | Total Bid | Total Bid | Total Bid | Total Bid | Total Bid | Tot@!Bid | \/pcard
Address of Service Bid | 1om 1 ltem2 | Item2 | Item3 | ltem3 | ltem4 | Item4 Level Level
Facility Item 1 w/Pcard w/Pcard w/Pcard w/Pcard 1,2,3 1,2,3
| Power Secure Service .
Ft. Worth, Tx No bid No bid | No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $81,670.00 | $81,670.00
Solomon Corporation _
Georgetown, Tx No bid No bid | No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
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