BID TABULATION

San Marcos Electric Utility Tools

January 11, 2018, 2:00 p.m.

IFB 218-137
Section | Section | Section | Section | Section | Section
Bidder Name One Two Three Four Five Six
Total Total Total Total Total Total
Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost
Wesco Distribution 14.888.58 | 123072 |12,151.52 | 11,693.87 | 26,351.38 | 5,451.12
San Antonio, TX
Techline Inc 18.047.00 | 1,355.00 | 14,732.00 | 11,966.00 | 25,127.00 |5,752.00
San Antonio, TX
Priester-Mell & Nicholson Inc | ¢y g5 [NOBID |NOBID |NOBID [NOBID |NOBID
Austin, TX
RAH Logistics & Consulting,
LLC NO BID 2,296.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 9,098.00
Houston, TX
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