BID TAB

May 03, 2018, 2:00 p.m.

ULATION

Patrol Dodge Charger Vehicle Equipment and Installation

Schertz, TX

IFB 218-202
Bidder Name Section One Section Two Section Three Section Four

Total P-Card Total P-Card Total P-Card Total P- Card
Cost Cost Cost Cost

Lone Star Products &

Equipment, LLC $36,823.30 | $37,574.79 | $22,422.10 | $22,978.68 | $9,609.70 | $9,805.81 | $13,455.00 | $13,729.59

Houston, TX

Rolltechs Specialty Vehicles

LLC $48,046.01 | No Bid $32,696.74 | No bid $10,260.72 | No bid $37,700.00 | No bid

Schertz, TX

Fet Sl Faulpment $37,687.08 | $37,687.08 | $21,522.10 | $21,522.10 | $8,153.60 | $8,153.60 | $13,500.00 | $13,500.00

Farrwest Specialty Vehicles | g9 303.25 | $49,303.25 | $27,547.22 | $27,547.22 | $10,125.30 | $10,125.30 | $40,275.00 | $40,275.00
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